
The US College Immersion Program (UCI) is a
transformative learning experience designed
to cultivate innovation, critical thinking,
problem-solving, and leadership among
students. As India surpasses China as the
leading source of international students in
the U.S., with over 330,000 Indian students
enrolled in 2024, the demand for quality
education, research opportunities, and
global career prospects continues to grow.
UCI provides an unparalleled opportunity for
aspiring students to explore top institutions,
develop essential skills, and gain a
competitive edge for their future.

Students get an insider’s view of globally
renowned institutions, participating in
specially curated workshops and campus
tours.

Direct interactions with top researchers and
scientists in STEM fields, fostering curiosity
and innovation.

A structured program designed to enhance
students' understanding of college
admissions, career pathways, and future
opportunities.

Students build connections with
professionals, mentors, and peers from
diverse backgrounds.

Real-world exposure beyond textbooks,
inspiring students to think critically and
creatively.

Certificates to students for
attending the workshops

About the Program

Why Should you
Join this program?

Program Starts on

Duration

Program Fee

Location

suparna@safaltaa.com

safaltaa.com

L a s t  D a y  t o  E n r o l l :  A p r i l  3 0 t h

A i r  t i c k e t s  a n d  V i s a  I n c l u d e d

Unlock Your Future with the US
College Immersion Program!

Exclusive University Access

8th June

7 Days / 6 Nights

7000 USD

East Coast

STEM & Innovation Exposure

Career & College Readiness

Global Networking

Hands-On Learning

Certificates

Safaltaa
Rise. Achieve. Succeed.



June 8th June 9th June 10th June 11th June 12th June 13th June 14th

Sunday Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday Saturday

7am to 8am
BREAKFAST

12.30 to
1.30 Lunch

Dinner and
Lights out

10.00pm. Room
check 10.10pm

Dinner and
Lights out

10.00pm. Room
check 10.10pm

Dinner and
Lights out

10.00pm. Room
check 10.10pm

Dinner and
Lights out

10.00pm. Room
check 10.10pm

Dinner and
Lights out

10.00pm. Room
check 10.10pm

Dinner and
Lights out

10.00pm. Room
check 10.10pm

Dinner and Lights
out 10.00pm.
Room check

10.10pm

12.30 to
1.30 Lunch

12.30 to
1.30 Lunch

12.30 to
1.30 Lunch

12.30 to
1.30 Lunch

12.30 to
1.30 Lunch

12.30 to
1.30 Lunch

7am to 8am
BREAKFAST

7am to 8am
BREAKFAST

7am to 8am
BREAKFAST

7am to 8am
BREAKFAST

7am to 8am
BREAKFAST

Arrive in
Boston and
Check In to

hotel

3.00-5.00pm:
Orientation,
Leadership

expectations and
Rules 6.00pm:
Guided Tour to
Charles River

8.00-9.00am:
Introduction and visit

to Eurekafest2025
@MIT

9.00 to 12.30pm:
Attend Presentations

by students and
workshop

3.00-8.00pm:
Visit to Harvard
University and

talk to Business
school experts
and counselors

Workshop on
Leadership

8.00 to 12.30
pm: Eurekafest
extravaganza,

network, talk to
Eurekafest

officials (Lead
by Rachna

Nath)

3.00 to 8.00pm:
Invention
Education

workshop at
MIT. Meet with

school teachers
and tour MIT

Campus

8.00 to
12.30pm Koch
Institute, MIT
visit and talk
to scientists

and workshop

2.00 to 5.00pm
NorthEastern

University Visit.
Free time

8.00 to 12.30pm
Boston

University Trip
and Counselor

meeting

2.00 to
5.00pm Ice

Cream
Museum Trip

8.00 to
12.30pm Hop
in / Hop Off

Trip of Boston

2.00pm to
5.00pm

Charles River
Trip And Sight

Seeing

8.00 to 12.30pm
End of trip
Discussion.
Leadership

assessment and
Survey. Feedback

on the Trip

FLIGHT BACK
TO INDIA

Tentative
Subjected
to change


